



EASTCONN COOPERATIVE

Milk Bid

August 1, 2018 - July 31, 2019

Item No.	Description	Unit Size	Volume 8/1/17 through 1/2018	Product Number	Brand	Firm Price	Fluctuating Price	Product Number	Brand	Firm Price	Fluctuating Price
36	Sour Cream	5 lb	525	505	Cabot	\$ 7.6000	\$ 7.0500	250	Cabot	no bid	\$ 6.5218
37	Sour Cream	1 lb	32	506	Dairy Pure	\$ 2.0000	\$ 1.8073	251	Guidas	no bid	\$ 1.7843
38	Cottage Cheese	1 lb.	27	516	Dairy Pure	\$ 2.2000	\$ 1.9921	301	Guidas	no bid	\$ 1.1808
39	Cottage Cheese	5 lb.	88	515	Cabot	\$ 7.0000	\$ 6.5500	300	Cabot	no bid	\$ 6.2277
	<b>Yogurts/Smoothies</b>										
40	Assorted flavors (Blueberry, Strawberry)	17.5 lb	40	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	43101	Cabot	no bid	\$ 23.6500
41	Trix - Strawberry banana	4 oz./48pk	64	716	Upstate	\$ 14.8800	\$ 14.8800	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
42	Assorted flavors	6 oz.	180	731	LaYogurt	\$ 7.4400	\$ 7.4400	48012	Yoplait	no bid	\$ 0.9261
43	Assorted flavors	quart	223	691	LaYogurt	\$ 2.6900	\$ 2.6900	47603	Yoplait	no bid	\$ 2.8301
44	Bolthouse - Amazing Mango	11oz./9pk	846	8624	Bolthouse	\$ 12.5100	\$ 12.5100	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
45	Bolthouse - Berry Boost	11oz./9pk	783	8621	Bolthouse	\$ 12.5100	\$ 12.5100	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
46	Bolthouse - Blue Goodness	11oz./9pk	558	8622	Bolthouse	\$ 12.5100	\$ 12.5100	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
	<b>Eggs</b>										
47	Eggs - large - dozen - carton	15/pk	153	806	Hillandale	no bid	\$ 17.5500	402	Guidas	no bid	\$ 2.1200
48	Eggs - 15 dozen to the box	loose	390	807	Hillandale	no bid	\$ 15.7500	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
49	Eggs - Xlarge - carton	dozen	240	809	Hillandale	no bid	\$ 1.0600	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
	<b>Water</b>										
50		8 oz.	3040	924	Kirkland	\$ 0.1450	\$ 0.1450	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
	<b>Ice Cream</b>										
51	Rainbow Pushups	24/pk	121	69751	Rich's	\$ 10.0400	\$ 10.0400	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
	<b>Miscellaneous</b>										
52	Wrapped Straws	500/pk	264	950	EBP	\$ 1.9500	\$ 1.9500	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

\* 12 case minimum delivery

\* will only supply 1 piece of equipment per school

\* will only have a 10 day code