

**EASTCONN FOOD COOPERATIVE  
BREAD BID  
August 1, 2017 - July 31, 2018**

Item No.	Item	Usable Slices	Oz per Package/Package Size	Weight	Volume	Calise & Sons Bakery				BIMBO Bakeries				
						Package/Oz/Slices if Different	Product Number	Unit Price	Bid Price	Package/Oz/Slices if Different	Product Number	Unit Price	Bid Price	
<b>BREADS:</b>														
1	Breadsticks - 8" Whole Grain - WGR		8 pack	13 oz.	607	13.6 oz.	1196	\$ 0.19	\$ 1.50				no bid	no bid
2	English Muffins, 100% Whole Wheat - WGR		6 pkg	13 oz.	2379		6110	\$ 0.19	\$ 1.15		7260	\$ 0.14	\$ 1.85	
3	Grain Bread - 12 - WGR	14	24 oz.	24 oz.	20	24.5 oz.	6127	\$ 0.16	\$ 2.25		170	\$ 0.08	\$ 1.91	
4	Marble	12		16 oz.	49	16 slices	2853	\$ 0.09	\$ 1.45				no bid	no bid
5	Pullman - White Wheat, Sandwich - 1/2" slices - WGR	26		24 oz.	5,156	24 slices	6103	\$ 0.06	\$ 1.50	22 usable slices	3239	\$ 0.07	\$ 1.65	
6	Pullman - 100% Whole Wheat, Sandwich -1/2" slices - WGR	26	22oz.	28oz	1,588	24 oz./18 slices	1541	\$ 0.11	\$ 1.90	24oz. 22 usable slices	6377	\$ 0.07	\$ 1.65	
7	Pullman - White Wheat, Sandwich - 1/2" slices - WGR	26	22 oz.	28 oz	115		6104	\$ 0.07	\$ 1.80				no bid	no bid
8	Rye	12		16 oz.	47	16 slices	2850	\$ 0.09	\$ 1.45	20oz. 19slices	6473	\$ 0.10	\$ 2.01	
9	Sandwich Thins - Whole Wheat		8 pkg	12 oz.	16	16 pack	6137	\$ 0.23	\$ 3.65				no bid	no bid
10	Stoneground 100% Whole Wheat - WGR	18	24 oz.	24 oz.	112	16 slices	1524	\$ 0.12	\$ 1.90		149	\$ 0.07	\$ 1.70	
11	Texas Toast	13	16 oz.		94	15 slices	6150	\$ 0.12	\$ 1.85	22oz. 17slices	27	\$ 0.07	\$ 1.60	
12	Whole Grain White Bread - WGR	18	20 oz.	20 oz.	2,611		1545	\$ 0.11	\$ 2.01				no bid	no bid
<b>ROLLS:</b>														
13	Bulkie - sliced, white		6 pack 2oz. Per roll		186		1133	\$ 0.23	\$ 1.35	18oz.	5257	\$ 0.13	\$ 2.39	
14	Dinner - Whole Wheat - WGR	12	12 pkg		13,285		1263	\$ 0.13	\$ 1.60	14oz.	7268	\$ 0.11	\$ 1.50	
15	Grinder - Wheat - 6" - WGR		12 pkg		8,385	6 pack	1185	\$ 0.22	\$ 1.30	12oz. 6pk	6375	\$ 0.14	\$ 1.68	
16	Grinder - White, 6"	6		15 oz.	111	16 oz.	1182	\$ 0.22	\$ 1.30	12oz. 6pk	8740	\$ 0.15	\$ 1.75	
17	Hamburger, Whole Wheat - WGR		12 pkg	40 oz	18,101		1703	\$ 0.14	\$ 1.70	32oz. 16pk	5198	\$ 0.07	\$ 2.16	
18	Hot Dog - New England - Top Split - WGR		16 pkg	24 oz.	5,494	8 pack	TBD	\$ 0.18	\$ 1.40				no bid	no bid
19	Hot Dog - New England, plain bag		16 pkg		31	12 pack	6105	\$ 0.15	\$ 1.75	22oz. 16pk	6811	\$ 0.10	\$ 2.11	
20	Hot Dog Rolls - Country Wheat - WGR		16 pkg	28 oz	2,029	8 pack	1704	\$ 0.18	\$ 1.40	32oz.	5196	\$ 0.07	\$ 2.16	
21	Kaiser Roll, Whole Grain, 4" - WGR	12		24 oz.	7,839	6 pack	1702	\$ 0.23	\$ 1.40	12pk	3242	\$ 0.07	\$ 1.70	
22	Kaiser Roll - Plain Bag Whole Grain, Large		6 pkg	13 oz.	1,223	15 oz.	1130	\$ 0.23	\$ 1.40				no bid	no bid
23	Salad Roll - WGR		16 pkg		136	12 pack	1910	\$ 0.15	\$ 1.75				no bid	no bid
24	Sub Roll, Medium, 100% Whole Wheat - WGR	6	25 oz.		47	25.7 oz.	1228	\$ 0.37	\$ 2.20				no bid	no bid
25	Sub Roll, Large, 100% Whole Wheat - WGR, 12"	6	33 oz.		265	33.4 oz.	1229	\$ 0.38	\$ 2.30				no bid	no bid
<b>SHELLS:</b>														
26	Pizza Shell - 12 x 16, Wheat	12	30 oz.		42	23 oz.	6311	\$ 3.21	\$ 38.50				no bid	no bid
<b>WRAPS:</b>														
27	Fresh Wheat - 12" - WGR		12 pkg		157		7155	\$ 0.22	\$ 2.60				no bid	no bid
<p>the items the members are looking for bid pricing on:  <a href="http://www.sde.ct.gov/sde/lib/sde/pdf/deps/nutrition/nslp/crediting/WGR_Criteria.pdf">http://www.sde.ct.gov/sde/lib/sde/pdf/deps/nutrition/nslp/crediting/WGR_Criteria.pdf</a></p>														

