

Paper & Office Supplies/Breakroom Supplies Bid 2018-2019

					Discount School Supply			School Specialty			W.B. Mason		
Item Number	Item Description	UOM	Volume 7/1/17-1/20/18	Awarded Vendor per item	Brand (if different)	Vendor Number	Price	Brand (if different)2	Vendor Number3	Price4	Brand (if different)3	Vendor Number4	Price5
Binders													
1	Avery® Economy Round Ring Reference Binder, 1" Capacity, Black	EA	87	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	086358	\$ 1.07		AVE03301	\$ 0.88
2	Avery® Economy View Binder w/Round Rings, 11 x 8 1/2, 1" Cap, Black	EA	145	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	086389	\$ 1.35		AVE05710	\$ 0.94
3	Avery® Economy Non-View Binder with Round Rings, 11 x 8 1/2, 2" Capacity, Black	EA	101	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	086371	\$ 1.64		AVE03501	\$ 1.66
4	Avery® Economy Vinyl Round Ring View Binder, 1" Capacity, White	EA	185	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	086388	\$ 1.35		AVE05711	\$ 0.96
5	Avery® Durable View Binder w/Slant Rings, 11 x 8 1/2, 1/2" Cap, White	EA	80	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		AVE17002	\$ 2.88
6	Avery® Economy View Binder w/Round Rings, 11 x 8 1/2, 2" Cap, White	EA	236	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	086394	\$ 1.77		AVE05731	\$ 1.68
7	Avery® Durable View Binder w/Slant Rings, 11 x 8 1/2, 1" Cap, White	EA	137	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1396554	\$ 2.92		AVE09301	\$ 1.68
8	Avery® Economy View Binder w/Round Rings, 11 x 8 1/2, 1/2" Cap, Black	EA	26	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	086386	\$ 1.35		AVE05705	\$ 0.96
9	Avery® Economy Non-View Binder with Round Rings, 11 x 8 1/2, 1" Capacity, Red	EA	242	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	086359	\$ 1.07		AVE03310	\$ 0.88
Breakroom Items													
10	Spring Water, 8 oz., 24/CT	CT	282	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		BLZ00824	\$ 3.69
11	Spring Water, 16.9 oz., 24/CT	CT	111	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		BLZ16924	\$ 3.99
12	Coca-Cola® Classic Coke, 12 oz. Can, 12/PK	PK	52	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CCC1230	\$ 5.44
13	Diet Coke® Diet Soda, 12 oz. Can, 12/PK	PK	76	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CCC1232	\$ 5.44
14	Coffee Fraction Packs, Colombian, 2.25oz., 24/CT	CT	73	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		MAG01503	\$ 13.18
Calendars													
15	House of Doolittle™ Recycled Economy 14-Month Academic Desk Pad Calendar, 22 x 17,	EA	34	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	1589026	\$ 3.75		HOD12502	\$ 6.26
16	House of Doolittle™ Recycled Compact Academic Desk Pad Calendar, 18 1/2 x 13, 2017-2018	EA	135	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		HOD1556	\$ 3.97
Clips													
17	ACCO® Small Binder Clips, Steel Wire, 5/16" Cap., 3/4"w, Black/Silver, Dozen	DZ	27	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	032397	\$ 0.16		ACC72020	\$ 0.22
18	ACCO® Medium Binder Clips, Steel Wire, 5/8" Cap., 1-1/4"w, Black/Silver, Dozen	DZ	264	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	032400	\$ 0.35		ACC72050	\$ 0.48
19	ACCO® Large Binder Clips, Steel Wire, 1 1/16" Capacity, 2"w, Black/Silver, Dozen	DZ	55	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	032403	\$ 0.86		ACC72100	\$ 0.99
20	Universal® Smooth Paper Clips, Wire, Jumbo, Silver, 100/Box	PK	188	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	084475	\$ 0.42		UNV72220BX	\$ 0.39
21	Universal® Paper Clips, Smooth Finish, No. 1, Silver, 100/Box	BX	214	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	084472	\$ 0.14		UNV72210BX	\$ 0.12
22	Universal® Medium Binder Clips, 5/8" Capacity, 1 1/4" Wide, Black, 12/Box	DZ	85	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	032400	\$ 0.35		UNV10210	\$ 0.48
Dividers													
23	Avery® Insertable Big Tab Dividers, 8-Tab, Letter	ST	199	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1308199	\$ 1.74		AVE11901	\$ 1.29
24	Avery® WorkSaver Big Tab Reinforced Dividers, Multicolor Tabs, 5-Tab, Ltr, Buff, 1/Set	ST	269	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1308188	\$ 0.90		AVE11109	\$ 0.44
25	Avery® Ready Index Customizable Table of Contents Multicolor Dividers, 5-Tab, Letter	ST	72	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	081940	\$ 0.25		AVE11131	\$ 1.03
26	Wilson Jones® Single-Sided Reinforced Insertable Index, Multicolor 8-Tab, Letter, Buff, 8/Set	ST	25	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	081933	\$ 0.36		WLI54311	\$ 0.58
Folders/Page Protectors													
27	ACCO® Presstex Report Cover, Prong Clip, Letter, 3" Capacity, Dark Blue	EA	50	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1053348	\$ 2.10		ACC25073	\$ 1.56
28	Oxford® Elegant Stripe Eight-Pocket Organizer, Embossed Leather Grain, Assorted Colors	EA	125	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		OXF99656	\$ 1.61
29	Universal® File Folders, 1/3 Cut Assorted, One-Ply Top Tab, Letter, Manila, 100/Box	BX	381	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	015741	\$ 4.44		WBM12113	\$ 3.88

Paper & Office Supplies/Breakroom Supplies Bid 2018-2019

					Discount School Supply			School Specialty			W.B. Mason		
Item Number	Item Description	UOM	Volume 7/1/17-1/20/18	Awarded Vendor per item	Brand (if different)	Vendor Number	Price	Brand (if different)2	Vendor Number3	Price4	Brand (if different)3	Vendor Number4	Price5
30	W.B. Mason Co. Two Pocket Portfolios, Assorted Colors, 25/BX	BX	132	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	084900	\$ 2.41	Oxford	OXF57513	\$ 3.61
31	Two-Pocket Portfolios, Red, 25/BX	BX	219	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	084895	\$ 2.35		OXF57511	\$ 3.61
32	Two-Pocket Portfolios, Green, 25/BX	BX	176	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	084894	\$ 2.35		OXF57503	\$ 3.61
33	Two-Pocket Portfolios, Light Blue, 25/BX	BX	146	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	084893	\$ 2.35		OXF57501	\$ 3.61
34	Two-Pocket Portfolios, Orange, 25/BX	BX	94	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		OXF57510	\$ 3.61
35	Two-Pocket Portfolios, Yellow, 25/BX	BX	231	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	084897	\$ 2.35		OXF57509	\$ 3.61
				Glue/Tape									
36	Avery® Permanent Glue Stics, White Application, 1.27 oz, Stick	EA	288	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid		748242	\$ 0.74		AVE00196	\$ 0.94
37	Elmer's® Washable School Glue, 4 oz, Liquid	EA	218	School Specialty		4EL	\$ 0.75		008970	\$ 0.49		EPIE304	\$ 0.58
38	Elmer's® Washable School Glue, 7.62 oz, Liquid	EA	111	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid		008973	\$ 0.82		EPIE308	\$ 0.97
39	Elmer's® Washable School Glue Sticks, 30/Box	PK	74	School Specialty		ELMWHITE	\$ 14.77		081454	\$ 7.31		EPIE556	\$ 8.61
40	Elmer's® Washable School Glue Stick	EA	144	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		024088	\$ 0.28		EPIE510	\$ 0.23
41	Highland™ Economy Masking Tape, 1" x 60yds, 3" Core, Cream	RL	71	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		040590	\$ 1.12		MMM260024A	\$ 0.91
42	Highland™ Transparent Tape, 1/2" x 1296", 1" Core, Clear	RL	66	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		040599	\$ 0.43		MMM5910121296	\$ 0.41
43	Highland™ Transparent Tape, 3/4" x 1296", 1" Core, Clear	RL	215	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		040602	\$ 0.62		MMM5910341296	\$ 0.59
*44	Highland™ Invisible Permanent Mending Tape, 3/4" x 1296", 1" Core, Clear	RL	702	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		040725	\$ 0.78		MMM6200341296V	\$ 0.61
				Misc.									
45	EnvironMelt® Ice Melt, 50 lb. bag	BG	147	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		KISENVIRONMELT	\$ 11.12
46	Gillette® Foamy® Regular Shave Foam, 2 oz.	EA	145	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		PGC14501	\$ 0.82
47	Paper Mate® Arrowhead Eraser Caps, 144/Box	BX	83	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1452929	\$ 4.10		PAP73015	\$ 3.74
48	Texas Instruments TI-30X IIS Scientific Calculator, 10-Digit LCD	EA	84	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid		033-6945	\$ 11.04		TEXT130XIIS	\$ 11.88
49	Universal® Hardboard Clipboard, 1" Capacity, Holds 8 1/2 x 11, Brown	EA	105	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	1272480	\$ 0.76		UNV40304	\$ 0.57
50	Universal® Woodcase Pencil, HB #2, Yellow Barrel, Dozen	DZ	137	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	Dixon	017646	\$ 1.35		UNV55400	\$ 0.56
				Erasers/Pens/Pencils/Markers/Highlighters/Crayons/Paint									
51	A&W Pencil Box	EA	90	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	1574181	\$ 0.79		AW38008	\$ 0.84
52	BIC® Brite Liner Highlighter, Chisel Tip, Fluorescent, 5 per Set	ST	42	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		038857	\$ 1.58		BICBLP1WASST	\$ 1.53
53	BIC® Round Stic Ballpoint Stick Pen, Blue Ink, Medium, Dozen	DZ	210	School Specialty		BTS028	\$ 2.17		027469	\$ 0.79		BICGSM11BE	\$ 0.88
54	BIC® Round Stic Ballpoint Stick Pen, Black Ink, Medium, Dozen	DZ	293	School Specialty		BTS027	\$ 2.17		027465	\$ 0.79		BICGSM11BK	\$ 0.88
55	BIC® Round Stic Xtra Precision & Xtra Life Ballpoint Pen, Red Ink, 1mm, Medium, Dozen	DZ	25	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		BICGSM11RD	\$ 0.88
56	BIC® Great Erase Grip Fine Point Dry Erase Marker, Assorted, 4/Set	ST	100	W.B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		089398	\$ 2.29		BICGDEP41ASST	\$ 1.91
57	Charles Leonard, Inc. Block Erasers	BX	100	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	000783	\$ 1.21		LEO71554	\$ 2.52
*58	Crayola® Classic Color Pack Crayons, Tuck Box, 8 Colors/Box	BX	585	School Specialty	Colorations	CRS8	\$ 0.58		007503	\$ 0.44		CYO520008	\$ 0.46

Paper & Office Supplies/Breakroom Supplies Bid 2018-2019

					Discount School Supply			School Specialty			W.B. Mason		
Item Number	Item Description	UOM	Volume 7/1/17-1/20/18	Awarded Vendor per item	Brand (if different)	Vendor Number	Price	Brand (if different)2	Vendor Number3	Price4	Brand (if different)3	Vendor Number4	Price5
*59	Crayola® Classic Color Pack Crayons, Tuck Box, 16 Colors/Box	BX	1049	School Specialty		C16	\$ 1.47		007512	\$ 0.86		CY0520016	\$ 0.88
60	Crayola® Classic Color Crayons	BX	125	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		215007	\$ 0.71		CY0520012	\$ 0.63
61	Crayola® Classic Color Pack Crayons, Tuck Box, 24/Box	BX	481	W.B Mason		C24	\$ 1.87		007521	\$ 1.10		CY0520024	\$ 0.93
62	Crayola® Large Crayons, Tuck Box, 8 Colors/Box	BX	366	W.B Mason		C8P	\$ 1.90		007542	\$ 1.13		CY0520080	\$ 1.02
63	Crayola® Non-Washable Markers, Fine Point, Classic Colors, 10/Set	ST	52	W.B Mason					1371172	\$ 1.73		CY0587726	\$ 1.52
64	Crayola® Non-Washable Markers, Broad Point, Bold Colors, 8/Set	ST	77	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		024046	\$ 1.67		CY0587732	\$ 1.48
65	Crayola® Washable Markers, Broad Point, Classic Colors, 8/Pack	ST	210	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		008196	\$ 2.55		CY0587808	\$ 1.86
66	Crayola® Long Barrel Colored Woodcase Pencils, 3.3 mm, Assorted Colors, 12/Set	ST	135	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		160-1456	\$ 1.30		CY0684012	\$ 1.19
67	Crayola® Washable Watercolor Paint, 8 Assorted Colors	EA	70	W.B Mason	Colorations	LWPACK	\$ 6.54		008190	\$ 1.49		CY0530525	\$ 1.31
68	Crayola® Non-Washable Markers, Fine Point, Classic Colors, 8/Set	ST	200	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		008172	\$ 1.67		CY0587709	\$ 1.46
69	Crayola® Non-Washable Markers, Broad Point, Classic Colors, 8/Set	ST	178	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		008148	\$ 1.67		CY0587708	\$ 1.46
70	Crayola® Classic Color Pack Crayons, 24 Colors/Box	BX	157	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CY0523024	\$ 0.93
71	Prang® Crayons Made with Soy, 8 Colors/Box	BX	50	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		001287	\$ 0.32		DIX00000	\$ 0.24
*72	Prang® Crayons Made with Soy, 16 Colors/Box	BX	600	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		001290	\$ 0.50		DIX00100	\$ 0.42
73	Dixon® Oriole Woodcase Pencil, HB #2, Yellow Barrel	DZ	100	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		038109	\$ 0.81		DIX12872DZ	\$ 0.72
74	Dixon® Woodcase Pencil, HB #2 Lead, Yellow Barrel, 144/Box	BX	44	School Specialty	No bid	No bid	No bid		1442986	\$ 7.18		DIX14412	\$ 7.88
75	Dixon® Oriole Woodcase Presharpened Pencil, HB #2, Yellow, Dozen	DZ	362	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		069839	\$ 0.94		DIX12886	\$ 0.82
*76	Ticonderoga® Pre-Sharpended Pencil, HB, #2, Yellow, Dozen	DZ	1674	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		087190	\$ 1.49		DIX13806	\$ 1.46
77	Ticonderoga® Woodcase Pencil, HB #2, Yellow Barrel, 96/Pack	PK	23	School Specialty	No bid	No bid	No bid		075258	\$ 9.34		DIX13872	\$ 9.99
*78	Ticonderoga® Woodcase Pencil, HB #2, Yellow, Dozen	DZ	1625	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		017646	\$ 1.35		DIX13882	\$ 1.18
79	Liqui-Mark® Colored Pencil Sets	ST	84	School Specialty	No bid	No bid	No bid	School Smart	245787	\$ 0.61		LMK63012	\$ 0.88
80	Liqui-Mark® Fluorescent Ink Highlighters - Yellow	DZ	29	School Specialty	No bid	No bid	No bid	School Smart	1354259	\$ 1.49	Universal	UNV08861	\$ 1.86
81	EXPO® Low Odor Dry Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Basic Assorted, 4/Set	ST	124	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		175136	\$ 2.72		SAN80074	\$ 2.08
82	EXPO® Low Odor Dry Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Assorted, 8/Set	ST	42	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		026284	\$ 5.45		SAN80078	\$ 4.44
83	EXPO® Dry Erase Eraser, Soft Pile, 5 1/8w x 1 1/4h	EA	217	W. B. Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		076878	\$ 1.46		SAN81505	\$ 1.19
84	EXPO® Dry Erase Surface Cleaner, 8oz Spray Bottle	EA	41	W.B Mason	No bid	No bid	No bid		059634	\$ 1.81		SAN81803	\$ 1.42
85	EXPO® Low Odor Dry Erase Marker, Fine Point, Assorted, 4/Set	ST	28	W.B Mason	Sharpie	SHARPCLR	\$ 14.66		175139	\$ 2.31		SAN86074	\$ 1.99
86	EXPO® Low Odor Dry Erase Marker, Bullet Tip, Black, Dozen	DZ	145	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1333729	\$ 8.57		SAN82001	\$ 6.48
87	Sharpie® Permanent Marker, Fine Point, Black, Dozen	DZ	41	W.B Mason		SHARPBLK	\$ 14.66		077399	\$ 7.30		SAN30001	\$ 5.04
88	EXPO® Low Odor Dry Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Black, Dozen	DZ	115	Discount School Supply		EXBLACK	\$ 5.00		1333744	\$ 8.57		SAN80001	\$ 6.07
89	EXPO® Low Odor Dry Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Green	EA	250	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		SAN80004	\$ 6.48
90	Universal™ Blackstonian Pencil, HB #2, Medium Soft, Yellow, Dozen	DZ	160	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		UNV55520	\$ 0.61
Paper/Notebooks													
91	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Bottle Rocket Blue, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	111	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201BE	\$ 3.54
92	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Cherry Charge, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	64	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201CHE	\$ 3.71

Paper & Office Supplies/Breakroom Supplies Bid 2018-2019

					Discount School Supply			School Specialty			W.B. Mason		
Item Number	Item Description	UOM	Volume 7/1/17-1/20/18	Awarded Vendor per item	Brand (if different)	Vendor Number	Price	Brand (if different)2	Vendor Number3	Price4	Brand (if different)3	Vendor Number4	Price5
93	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Cracking Canary, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	321	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201CY	\$ 3.54
94	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Popper-mint Green, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	178	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201GN	\$ 3.54
95	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Golden Glimmer, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	88	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201GRP	\$ 3.54
96	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Luminous Lavender, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	40	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201LV	\$ 3.54
97	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Powder Pink, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	105	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201PK	\$ 3.54
98	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Pumpkin Glow, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	32	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201PKN	\$ 3.71
99	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Jammin' Salmon, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	126	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201SN	\$ 3.54
100	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Turbulent Turquoise, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	56	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201TT	\$ 3.54
101	Boise® FIREWORX Colored Paper, 20lb, 8-1/2 x 11, Flashing Ivory, 500 Sheets/Ream	RM	25	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		CASMP2201IY	\$ 3.54
*102	Mead® Spiral Bound Notebook, Perforated, Legal Rule, 8 x 10 1/2, White, 70 Sheets	EA	540	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	085267	\$ 0.48		MEA05510	\$ 0.77
103	Mead® Spiral Bound Notebook, Perforated, College Rule, 8 x 10 1/2, White, 70 Sheets	EA	373	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1481124	\$ 1.04		MEA05512	\$ 0.77
104	Mead® Square Deal Composition Book, Legal Rule, 9 3/4 x 7 1/2, White, 100 Sheets	EA	80	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1438373	\$ 1.09		MEA09910	\$ 1.06
105	Mead® Square Deal Composition Book, College Rule, 9 3/4 x 7 1/2, White, 100 Sheets	EA	291	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		MEA09932	\$ 1.06
106	Mead® Filler Paper, 15lb, College Rule, 11 x 8 1/2, White, 200 Sheets	PK	30	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	085289	\$ 1.05		MEA17208	\$ 2.62
107	Five Star® Advance Wirebound Notebook, College Rule, 8 1/2 x 11, 1 Subject, 100 Sheets	EA	140	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid		1438384	\$ 3.23		MEA06322	\$ 3.81
108	Highland™ Self-Stick Pads, 3 x 3, Yellow, 100 Sheets/Pad, 12 Pads/Pack	PK	29	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid		077320	\$ 2.23		MMM6549YW	\$ 2.33
109	Oxford® Twisted Twin Pocket Folder, 100-Sheet Capacity, Assorted	EA	92	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		OXF55774	\$ 0.46
110	Pacon, Book, composition, 9.75x7.75, 120pg, Marble	EA	190	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	Roaring Springs	1450022	\$ 1.38		PACMMK37118	\$ 0.48
111	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 9 x 12, Black, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	31	W.B Mason		9SULFBK	\$ 1.66		1006763	\$ 1.00		PAC103029	\$ 0.97
112	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 12 x 18, White, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	54	School Specialty		12SULFWH	\$ 3.03		054141	\$ 1.59		PAC103058	\$ 1.87
113	Pacon® Composition Paper, Red Margin, 5-Hole Punched, 8 x 10-1/2, White, 500 Shts/Pk	PK	54	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	085283	\$ 1.91		PAC2441	\$ 2.16
114	Pacon® Composition Paper, 16 lbs., 8-1/2 x 11, White, 500 Sheets/Pack	PK	102	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	085433	\$ 2.27		PAC2403	\$ 2.26
115	Pacon® Composition Book, 9-3/4 x 7-1/2, 3/8 Ruled, Soft Cover, Black Marble, 100 Sheets	EA	25	W.B Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		PACMMK37117	\$ 0.67
*116	Pacon® Marble Cover Composition Book, Flexible Cover, Square Corners, Wide Ruled, 7" x 8-1/2", 48 Sheets/96 Pages	EA	3066	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	002058	\$ 0.22		PACMMK37123	\$ 0.36
117	Pacon® Marble Cover Composition Book, 7 3/4" x 9 3/4", Wide Ruling with Red Margin, 60 Sheets/120 Pages	EA	401	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	002052	\$ 0.43		PACMMK37130	\$ 0.46
*118	Pacon® Marble Cover Composition Book, Flexible Cover, Square Corners, Wide Ruled, 7" x 8-1/2", 36 Sheets/72 Pages	EA	2048	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	002046	\$ 0.18		PACMMK37122	\$ 0.27
*119	Pacon® Marble Cover Composition Book, Hard Cover, Round Corners, Wide Ruled, 7-1/2" x 9-3/4", 100 Sheets/200 Pages	EA	545	W.B Mason	no	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		PACMMK37101	\$ 0.61

Paper & Office Supplies/Breakroom Supplies Bid 2018-2019

					Discount School Supply			School Specialty			W.B. Mason			
Item Number	Item Description	UOM	Volume 7/1/17-1/20/18	Awarded Vendor per item	Brand (if different)	Vendor Number	Price	Brand (if different)2	Vendor Number3	Price4	Brand (if different)3	Vendor Number4	Price5	
120	Pacon® Grade School Ruled Composition Book, Grade 1, Green, 7 3/4" x 9 3/4", 1" Ruling, 50 Sheets/100 Pages	EA	117	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	085298	\$ 0.30		PACMMK37140	\$ 0.43	
121	Pacon® Stitched Cover Blue Tag Composition Book, 8" x 10 1/2", 3/8" Ruling with Red Margin, 48 Sheets/96 Pages	EA	116	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid		085310	\$ 0.27		PACMMK37134	\$ 0.45	
122	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 9 x 12, White, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	85	School Specialty		9SULFWH	\$ 1.66		1006764	\$ 0.80		PAC103026	\$ 0.88	
123	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 12 x 18, Festive Green, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	40	W.B Mason		12SULFRE-Green	\$ 3.03		054075	\$ 2.26		PAC103038	\$ 1.89	
124	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 9 x 12, Assorted, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	22	W.B Mason		9SULFAS	\$ 1.66		054054	\$ 1.16		PAC103031	\$ 1.09	
125	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 9 x 12, Orange, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	31	W.B Mason & School Specialty		9SULFOR	\$ 1.66		053964	\$ 1.02		PAC103002	\$ 1.02	
126	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 12 x 18, Festive Red, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	41	W.B. Mason		9SULFRE	\$ 3.03		054651	\$ 2.05		PAC103432	\$ 1.87	
127	Pacon® Tru-Ray Construction Paper, 76 lbs., 9 x 12, Yellow, 50 Sheets/Pack	PK	34	W.B. Mason		9SULFYE	\$ 1.66		053970	\$ 1.00		PAC103004	\$ 0.91	
128	Pacon® Composition Paper, 1/4" Quadrille, 16 lbs., 8-1/2 x 11, White, 500 Sheets/Pack	PK	54	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	085277	\$ 2.44		PAC2411	\$ 2.56	
129	Pacon® Graph Paper, 8.5" x 11", 1/2" Ruling, 500/RM Roaring Spring® Grade School Ruled Composition Book, 9-3/4 x 7-3/4, Red Cover, 50 Pages	RM	29	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	085279	\$ 2.85		PACL00778002211	\$ 3.52	
130	Flagship™ Bright Premium Bright Copy Paper, 8.5" x 11", 20 lb., Extra Bright, 5000/CT	EA	100	W. B. Mason	DSS	BTS016	\$ 1.22	no bid	no bid	no bid		PACMMK37142	\$ 0.43	
131	Neeenah Paper Bright White Card Stock, 65 lbs., 8-1/2 x 11, Bright White, 250 Sheets/Pack	CT	80	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		WBM97200	\$ 27.33	
132	Flagship™ Copy Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", 20lb., 92 Bright, 5000/CT	PK	26	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid		1301559	\$ 9.43		WAU91904	\$ 12.44	
*133	Universal® Unruled Index Cards, 3 x 5, White, 100/Pack	CT	4106	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	High Speed	1289142	\$ 28.54		WBM21200	\$ 26.28	
134	Universal® Ruled Index Cards, 3 x 5, White, 100/Pack	PK	165	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	088708	\$ 0.29		UNV47200	\$ 0.31	
*135	Universal® Ruled Index Cards, 3 x 5, White, 100/Pack	PK	1066	School Specialty	EPI	BTS034	\$ 0.73	School Smart	088706	\$ 0.29		UNV47210	\$ 0.31	
136	Universal® Unruled Index Cards, 4 x 6, White, 100/Pack	PK	38	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	088712	\$ 0.52		UNV47220	\$ 0.61	
137	Universal® Ruled Index Cards, 4 x 6, White, 100/Pack	PK	132	School Specialty	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	088710	\$ 0.52		UNV47230	\$ 0.61	
138	Universal® Ruled Index Cards, 5 x 8, White, 100/Pack	PK	115	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	School Smart	088713	\$ 0.88		UNV47250	\$ 0.74	
Rulers/Staplers/Hole Punch/Sharpener/Scissors														
139	Fiskars® High Performance Student Scissors, 7 in. Length, 2-3/4 in. Cut	EA	125	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1334387	\$ 2.58		FSK1294587097J	\$ 1.86	
140	Stanley Bostitch® Full Strip Standard Chisel Point Staples, 1/4 Inch Leg Length, 5,000/Box	BX	100	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1074621	\$ 0.79		UNV79000	\$ 0.53	
141	Swingline® S.F. 1 Standard Economy Chisel Point 210 Full-Strip Staples, 5000/Box	BX	168	School Specialty	Office Mate	5000	\$ 0.89		3211841	\$ 0.52		SWI35108	\$ 0.69	
142	Swingline® Commercial Full Strip Desk Stapler, 20-Sheet Capacity, Black	EA	48	School Specialty	DSS	BVST	\$ 5.73		061188	\$ 4.43		SWI44401S	\$ 5.61	
143	Westcott® 12" Jewel Colored Ruler	EA	214	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		1496051	\$ 0.68		ACM12975	\$ 0.51	
144	Universal® Desktop Tape Dispenser, 1" Core, Weighted Nonskid Base, Black	EA	34	W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid		038174	\$ 7.95		UNV15001	\$ 0.99	
Paper by the Trailer Load *optional*														
145	Multi Purpose, 8 1/2 x 11, 98 bright, 20lb.			W. B. Mason	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		RBB61200	\$ 28.33	
					* Free delivery w/\$99 purchase						* Offers electronic ordering			

